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SITE REMEDIATION
When you are faced with contamination 
from pollutants or contamination at your 
site – whether it be in the soil, groundwater, 
sediment, surface water, or other source 
– protecting the environment, assets and 
public health is critical.

BELFOR Environmental provides 
professional site remediation services 
– the removal of such contaminants – 
with minimal business disruption and 
complete discretion.  We are able to 
perform any size project, from mass 
excavation of contaminated soil to the 
removal of a small underground storage 
tank.

BELFOR SERVICES
Our site remediation services include:

   •   �Underground Storage Tank Removal
   •   �Contaminated Soil Excavation
   •   �Treatment System O&M
   •   �Demolition Services
   •   �Asbestos Abatement
   •   �Emergency Spill Response
   •   �Remediation System Installation
	 •  �Soil Vapor Extraction
	 •  �Groundwater Pump and Treat
	 •  �Air Sparging
	 •  Treatment/Injection
	 •  Reconstruction

Our trained technicians are able to assess 
and investigate the site to determine if the 
levels of hazardous substances have or 
are in imminent danger of being released, 
causing danger to public health or the 
environment. In doing so, they are able 
to recommend the safest and most cost-
effective solution for site remediation.

All of our site remediation projects are 
handled in compliance with all local, state 
and federal regulations.

STORAGE TANK REMOVAL 
Both underground and above ground 
storage tanks often leak, causing 
significant environmental contamination. 
For the removal of these tanks, property 
owners can trust BELFOR Environmental.

Our professional environmental cleaning 
teams have removed countless numbers 
of storage tanks, pipes and pumps. We  
have the experience, equipment and 
know-how to safely remove and dispose 
of the tanks and contamination.

CONTAMINATED SOIL EXCAVATION
When hazardous contaminants are 
buried, spilled or have migrated into the 
soil, BELFOR Environmental can help.

From a small patch of contaminated 
soil to thousands of acres, BELFOR 
Environmental is experienced in the 
excavation, treatment and disposal of 
contaminated soil. 

TREATMENT SYSTEMS 
BELFOR Environmental offers treatment 
system remediation services including  
system installation, modifications and 
upgrades to existing treatment systems, 
and routine system operation and 
maintenance services.

Our experience ranges from small  to 
complex soil remediation projects and 
treatment systems.


